
ORIGINAl 

ORDINANCE NO. 121 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF WOODINVILLE, 
WASHINGTON, REPEALING ORDINANCES 35 AND 36, 
RELATING TO BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION; 
ESTABLISHING PROVISIONS FOR A BUILDING CODE, A 
MECHANICAL CODE, A PLUMBING CODE, AN ELECTRICAL 
CODE, A SEWAGE DISPOSAL SYSTEMS CODE, A SIGN 
CONSTRUCTION CODE, AND A DANGEROUS BUILDING 
CODE, AND A FIRE CODE. 

WHEREAS, the Legislature of the State of Washington directs cities to enforce the State 
Building Code, and 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is in the best interest of the public health, safety, 
and general welfare to establish comprehensive, uniform, and current procedures and requirements 
for buildings and construction within the City of Woodinville, NOW, THEREFORE 

THE CITY COUNCll, OF THE CITY OF WOODINVll,LE, WASIDNGTON, DO 
ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS 

1.1 

1.2 

1.3 

1.4 

1.5 

Short title. Tbis title is known as and may be referred to as the "Buildings and 
Construction Code". 

Pm:pose. The purpose of the codes and regulations adopted in this title is to regulate 
buildings and construction within the City and to promote the public healtl1, safety, 
and welfare of the general public, and not to create or otherwise establish or 
designate any particular class or group of persons who will or should be especially 
protected by the terms of these codes and regulations. 

Building Department Established. There is established for the City the "Building 
Department" which shall be under the supervision and control of the City Manager 
or his/her authorized representative. 

Code Enforcement. There is established a code enforcement agency which shall be 
under the administration and operational control of the Building Official. 

Building Official designated. The "Building Official", as defmed in Section 104.2 
of the Uniform Building Code and Section 108 of the Uniform Mechanical Code, 

1 



H 
! ) , __ / 

1.6 

1.7 

ORIG~NAL 

and the "Administrative Authority" as defined by the Plumbing Code, shall be 
appointed by the City Manager. 

Administration and enforcement. Except as otherwise provided in this title, the . 
provisions of this title shall be administered and enforced by the Building Official of 
the City. 

Fire Chief and Fire Marshal designated. 

.1 The Chief of Woodinville Fire and Life Safety District shall 
be deemed to be the "chief' or "chief of the fire department" 
for the pnrposes of this ordinance . 

• 2 The fire marshal of Woodinville Fire and Life Safety District 
shall be deemed to the "fire marshal" for the pnrposes of this 
ordiriance. 

1.8 Fees. Except as otherwise provided in this ordinance, the fee for any permit issued 
by the City under the authority of this ordinance shall be established by the City 
Manager. 

1.9 Construction Code Administration 

.1 Hours of construction. Except as otherwise provided in this ordinance, the 
activities regulated by this ordinance shall be limited to the following hours: 

Monday through Saturday: 
Sunday and legal holidays: 

7 a.m. to 7 p.m. 
10 a.m. to 7 p.m . 

. 2 Adoption by reference. The codes, standards, rules, and regulations adopted 
by this ordinance are adopted by reference thereto as though fully set forth 
herein. Not less than one (1) copy of each such codes, standards, rules, and 
regulations, in the form in which it was adopted, and suitably marked to 
indicate amendments, additions, deletions, and exceptions as provided herein, 
shall be filed in the Building Official's office and be available for use and 
examination by the public . 

• 3 Code conflicts--Resolution . 

. 1 In case of conflict among the Building Code, the 
Mechanical Code, the Fire Code, and the Plumbing Code, the 
first named code shall govern over those following. 

2 



PI .\ / 

A 
I ' 
' -.. ____ "_.· 

.4 

.5 

ORIG~NAl 

.2 In case of conflicts between otl1er codes and provisions 
adopted by this ordinance, fue code or provision fuat is 
determined to be most restrictive by fue Building Official, shall 
apply. 

Liabili1y. Tins ordinance shall not be construed to relieve or lessen fue 
responsibility of any person, partnership, firm, association, or corporation 
owning, building, altering, constructing, or moving any building or structure 
as defmed in this ordinance; nor shall fue City or any agent fuereof be held as 
assuming such liability by reason of inspection aufuorized herein or a 
certificate of inspection issued by fue City or any of its agencies. Provided, 
fue purpose of this code is not be create or ofuerwise establish or designate any 
particular class or group of persons who will or should be especially protected 
by fue terms of this code. 

Interpretation. Whenever fue underlined words appear on fue codes adopted 
by reference in this ordinance fuey are to be interpreted as follows: 

.1 Administrative Aufuori1y as fue Building Official; 

.2 Chief, or Fire Chief or fue Chief of the Bureau of Fire 
Prevention as fue Fire Chief of Woodinville Fire and Life 
Safety District; 

.3 Corporation Counsel as fue City Attorney; 

.4 Ci1y Treasurer as fue Director of Finance; 

.5 Local Zoning Code as fue City of Woodinville Zoning 
Code; 

.6 Municipal and fue Jurisdiction as fue City of Woodinville . 

. 6 Violations and penalties . 

. 1 Civil violation. Except as ofuerwise provided in this ordinance, any 
violation of any offue provisions of this ordinance shall constitute a civil 
infraction for winch a monetary penalty as set forfu in Ordinance 16 may be 
imposed . 

. 2 Criminal penal1y. Except as ofuerwise provided in this ordinance, in 
addition to or as an alternative to any oilier penalty provided in this 
ordinance or by law, every person, partnership, firm, association, or 

3 



A 

,~ 

1-------'l I , 

'-~ 

ORIGINAL 
corporation convicted of a violation of any provision of tills ordinance shall 
be guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof, punished as set 
forth in ordinance No 16. 

Section 2. CONSTRUCTION CODES 

2.1 Pursuant to State Law (RCW Chapter 19.27) the Woodinville Building Code is the 
Washlngton State Building Code. The Washlngton State Building Code is 
composed of the following elements: 

.1 The 1994 Uniform Building Code (UBC) volumes 1, 2, and 3 including the 

.2 

.3 

.4 

.5 

.6 

.7 

.8 

.9 

Standards published/issued by the International Conference of Building 
Officials (ICBO); 
1994 Uniform Sign Code (USC) published/issued by ICBO; 
1991 Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC) published by ICBO and issued by 
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials; 
1994 Uniform Mechanical Code (UMC) published/issued by ICBO; 
1994 Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings published/issued 
byiCBO; 
1994 Uniform Fire Code volumes 1 & 2 including the standards published by 
ICBO and issued by the International Fire Code Institute; 
Chapter 51.11 WAC-- Washlngton State Energy Code 1995 
Edition; 
Chapter 51.13 WAC-- Washlngton State Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality 
Code 1995 Edition; and 
Chapter 51-19 WAC-- Washlngton State Historic Building Code 1995 
Edition 

All amendments, supplements, modifications, exclusions, exemptions, and additions to the codes 
identified in subparagraphs 1 - 7 above by the Washlngton State Building Code Council and 
published in Title 51 Washlngton Administrative Code, including, but no by way oflimitation, 
WAC Chapters 51-11,51-13,51-19 and 51-30, excluding section1006.3. 

Section 3. CONSTRUCTION CODES ADOPTED 

3.1 Short Title. This chapter is known as and maybe referred to as the "Building Code" 

.1 Building Code Adopted. The Uniform Building Code volumes 1, 2, and 3 
including Standards, 1994 Editions, issued and published by the International 
Association of Building Officials is adopted in its' entirety, including Appendix 
Chapters 4, Swinuning Pool Barriers; 15, Reroofmg; 16, Div. #1 Structural Forces; 
18, Foundation and Waterproofing; 29, Minimum Plumbing Fixtures; 31, Div. #2, 
Membrane Structures; 33, Excavation and Grading; 34 Div. #1, Existing Structures; 

4 



A ' ' = 

c; 

OfUGINAL 

toge1her with Washington State Building Code Council Amendments; and the City 
of Woodinville amendments hereafter listed. 

UBC Section 105.1 Board of appeals is hereby amended to read as follows: 

.2 UBC Section 105.1 Board of Appeals. In order to hear and decide appeals of 
orders, decisions, or determinations made by 1he Building Official to 1he application 
of this code, 1here shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals consisting of 
five members who are qualified by experience and training to pass upon matters 
pertaining to building construction. The Building Official shall be an ex-officio 
member and shall act as Secretary of1he board. The Board of Appeals members 
shall be appointed by 1he City Manager, and shall serve for not more 1han two four­
yearterms or until their successor is appointed and qualified. The Board shall adopt 
reasonable rules of procedure for conducting its business, and shall render all 
decisions and findings in writing to 1he appellant wi1h a duplicate copy to the 
Building Official." 

.3 UBC Section 106.3.1 of1he Uniform Building Code is amended and 
supplemented by 1he addition 1hereof of new subsections to be known as UBC 
Subsection 106.3.1(8), (9), (10), (11), (12), (13), (14) and (15). 

106.3.1(8); As much information as required to provide an accurate 
environmental disclosure. 

106.3.1 (9). The legal description, or the tax parcel number assigned 
pursuant to RCW 84.40.160, and 1he street address if available, and may 
include any oilier identification of 1he construction site by 1he prime 
contractor; 

106.3.1 (1 0). The property owner's name, address, and phone number; 

106.3.1(11). The prime contractor's business name, address, phone 
number, current state contractor registration number." 

Hi6.3.1(12) At 1he time of filing a building permit application, 1he 
applicant shall submit all information required to be submitted, toge1her 
with any application form and applicable fees 1herefore, for any of the 
following approvals which may be applicable to the proposed project: 

.1 Design Review; 

.2 Shorelines substantial development permit; 

5 



A 
\_i 

.3 Land clearing, grading, or filling permit. 

.4 Site development permit . 

. 5 Street development consistent with the City's grid road ordinance. 

106.3.1(13) No building permit application shall be accepted for filing 
by the Building Official for any proposed project for which any of the 
approvals referred to in subsection 1 06.3.1.(12) are required unless the 
building permit application is accompanied by all information required 
to be filed for such required approvals. 

106.3.1(14)When the City Engineer determines that certain 
improvements including, but not limited to, curbs, gutters, sidewalks, 
driveways across sidewalks, piped storm drainage, retaining walls, street 
illumination, landscaping, slope protection, and underground utilities are 
required at some future date by existing ordinance(s), no building permit 
application shall be approved by the Building Official for any proposed 
project unless the building permit application is accompanied by a 
properly executed Local Improvement District (LID) Covenant that has 
been recorded at the King County Department of Records. 

UBC S\lbsection 1 06.3.1(15). The requirements for a fully complete 
building permit application include compliance with Sections 106.3.1 (1) 
through 106.3.1(15) and with RCW 19.27.097 (which relates to water 
supply); 

.4 UBC Subsection 106.3.3 of the Uniform Building Code is amended 
and supplemented by the addition thereto of a new paragraph to read: 
"All building and land surface modification (grading) permits, shall 
expire one (1) year from the date of issue. Building and grading permits 
may be renewed for one half (1/2) of the original permit fee which will 
extend the permit(s) an additionall/2 year. No permit shall be active 
including renewals for longer than 18 months." 

.5 Uniform Building Code Section 107.4 amended--Expiration of plan review. 
Section 107.4 of the Uniform Building Code, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

107.4.1 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is 
issued within 180 calendar days following the date of application filing, 
or the applicant fails to respond to plan review request for 60 calendar 
days, shall expire by limitation, and plans and other data submitted for 

6 



[: 

ORIGINAL 

review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the 
Building Official. The Building Official may extend the time for action 
by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 calendar days on request 
by the applicant showing that circumstances beyond the control of the 
applicant have prevented action from being taken. No application shall 
be extended more than once. In order to renew action on an application 
after expiration, the applicant shall reapply and pay a new plan review 
fee. 

UBC Section 107.4.2 The Building Official shall extend the life of an 
application if any of the following conditions exists: 

1 07.4.2.1 Compliance with a declaration of significance under the State 
Environmental Policy Act provisions is in progress; or 

107.4.2.2 Any other city review is in progress, provided City staff 
determines that the review is proceeding to a timely final City decision; 
or 

107.4.2.3 Litigation against the City is in progress, the outcome of which 
may affect the validity of any permit issued pursuant to such 
application. 

107.4.3 Permit deemed ready to issue. Every permit deemed ready to 
issue by the Building Official under the provisions of this code shall be 
obtained by the applicant within 60 days of the notification of the 
availability of such permit by the Building Official. Upon cancellation 
of any such permit, the permit becomes null and void, and the Building 
Official shall so notify the applicant by certified mail." 

.6 UBC Section 108.5.6 is hereby amended by the addition of a new 
paragraph to read: "Buildings that have not received a final approval 
shall not be occupied without written approval of the Building Official." 

.7 UBC Section 109.5 

UBC Subsection 109.5.2. Premise Identification. Approved numbers or 
addresses of a size not less than three inches (3 ") in height shall be 
placed on all new and existing buildiBgs and on construction sites in 
such a position as to be plainly visible and legible from the street or road 
fronting the property. Said numbers shall contrast with their 
background. 

7 



ORIGINAl 

.8 UBC Subsection 302.5 Mechanical Equipment Room Occupancy 
Separation. In Groups A; B; E; F; I; M; R, Division 1; and S 
Occupancies, rooms containing a boiler, central heating plant or hot­
water supply boiler shall be separated from the rest of the building by 
not less than a one-hour occupancy separation. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

1. In Groups B, F, I, M and S Occupancies, boilers, central 
heating plants or hot-water supply boilers accumulative Btu 
load within the room does not exceed 400,000 Btu per hour 
(117.2 kW) input. 
2. In Group R, Division 1 Occupancies, a separation need not 
be provided for such rooms with equipment serving only one 
dwelling unit 
3. In Groups A and E Occupancies shall be separated from 
heating equipment by one-hour occupancy separation. 
4. All other occupancies where accumulative BTU load is 
over 400,000, BTU will require a minimum of one hour fire 
protection. 

In Group E Occupancies, when the opening for a heater or equipment room is protected by 
a pair of fire doors, the inactive leaf shall be normally secured in the closed position and 
shall be openable only by the use of a tool. An astragal shall be provided and the active leaf 
shall be self-closing. 

In Group H Occupancies, rooms containing a boiler, central heating plant or hot-water 
supply boiler shall be separated from the rest of the building by not less than a two-hour 
occupancy separation. In Divisions 1 and 2, there shall be no openings in such occupancy 
separation except for necessary ducts and piping. 
For opening in exterior walls of equipment rooms in Groups A, E or I Occupancies, see 
Section 303.8 . 

• 9 Section 302.6. Water Closet Room Separation. A room in which a water closet 
is located shall be separated from food preparation or storage rooms by a tight­
fitting door . 

. 10 UBC Section 310.2.2. Special Provisions_amended--Construction, height, and 
allowable areas. Section 310.2.2 of the Unifoiiil Building Code, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

8 



ORIGINAl 
Storage or laundry rooms that are within Group R, Division 1 Occupancies that are 
used in common by tenants shall be separated from the rest of the building by not 
Jess than one-hour fire-resistive occupancy separation. 

For Group R, Division 1 Occupancies with a Group S, Division 3 parking garage in 
the basement or first story, see Section 311.2.2. 
For attic space partitions and draft stops, see Section 708. 

UBC Section 31 0.2.2.1 Special Provisions. Notwithstanding other 
provisions of this code, Group R Division 1 occupancies shall be not 
Jess than one hour fire resistance construction throughout. Exterior 
balconies extending beyond the floor area as defined by Section 407 
shall be constructed of non combustible materials or as combustible 
one-hour fire resistant occupancies separation between units from 
lowest floor subsurface to the roofdeck. 

UBC Section 31 0.2.2.2 "Exterior and interior doors and windows 
opening onto a common corridor, stairway, or similar area serving 3 
or more dwelling units shall be protected as specified in Section 
1005.8." 

.11 Uniform Building Code Section 403 amended -- Title change. The title of 
section 403 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

"Special Provisions for all buildings seven or more stories in height" 

.12 UBC Section 403.1 amended--Scope. Section 403.1 of the Uniform Building 
Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

.13 Scope. This section shall apply to all buildings seven or more stories in height. 
Such buildings shall be provided with an approved sprinkler system in accordance 

with Section 1807(c) . 

. 14 UBC Section 1804.7 amended--Drainage. Section 1804.7 of the UBC is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

UBC Subsection 1804.7 Drainage. Provisions shall be made for the 
control and drainage of surface water around buildings. 

UBC Subsection 1804.7.1 Adequate provisions shall be made to insure 
that under floor spaces remain free of running water or standing water by 
the installation of drains. As a minimum, such drains shall be installed 
around the perimeter of the buildings at the footings. Additional drains 

9 



A 
' ' '~ 

A ·• ) "--/ 

OfilNG~NAl 

may be required on the under floor space. The drain pipes shall be of 
sufficient size to adequately convey water to an approved location, but 
shall be a minimum size of 4 inches. Provisions shall be made to 
prevent the drainage system from becoming blocked . 

. 15 UBC Section 904.2.2 amended--Added item. Section 3 802(b) of the UBC is 
hereby amended by the addition of item to be known as subsection 904.2.2 6 to 
read: 

.6 All buildings four or more stories in height. For the purposes of this section, a 
sto1y shall be defmed as that portion of a building included between the upper 
surface of any floor and the surface of the next floor or roof above . 

. 16 UBC Section 904 amended--Plan approval. Add to Section 904 of the 
Uniform Building Code, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended by the 
addition of the following subsection to read as follows: 

UBC Subsection 904.2.9. Approval of Sprinkler System Plans. If 
required by the Fire Marshal, sprinkler system plans shall be 
approved and stamped by an independent review agency approved 
by the Building Official prior to being submitted for approval. 

.17 UBC Section 904.2. amended--Area separation walls. Section 904.2 of the 
Uniform Building Code, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended by the 
addition of the following subsection to read as follows: 
UBC Subsection 904.2.7 Area Separation Walls. Areas separation 
walls as specified in Section 504.6 of the Uniform Building Code 
shall not be used to reduce calculation of floor areas in this chapter. 

.18 UBC Section 904.5.2. amended--Standpipes required. Section 904.5.2 of the 
UBC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

UBC Subsection 904.5.2 Where required, standpipe systems shall be 
provided as set forth on Table No. 9-A. In lieu of Class II standpipes, 
the Fire Chief may, in writing, require the use of Class I standpipes. The 
size and number of outlets, location of inlets and outlets and location of 
piping and fittings shall be approved by the Fire Chief or his/her 
designee. 

· Section 4 MECHANICAL CODE 

4.1. Short Title. This chapter is known as and may be referred to as the "Mechanical 
Code" (UMC). 

10 



\'"i 
~\._ ______ ... -1 

4.2. Mechanical Code Adopted. The Uniform Mechanical Code issued and published by 
the International Association of Building Officials 1994 Edition adopted in its 
entirety, including Mechanical and Building Standards and Appendix A, B, C and 
D, together with Washington State Building Code Council Amendments and The 
City of Woodinville amendments hereafter listed. 

4.3. Woodinville Amendments to the 1994 Uniform Mechanical Code . 

. 1. UMC Section 114.4.1 --Expiration of permit amended. Add to Section 114.4.1 
Every permit will expire one year after issuance . 

. 2. UMC Section 115.4 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for 
which no permit is issued within 180 calendar days following the date of 
application filing, or the applicant fails to respond to plan review request 
for 60 calendar days, shall expire by limitation, and plans and other data 
submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or 
destroyed by the Building Official. The Building Official may extend the 
time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 calendar 
days on request by the applicant showing that circumstances beyond the 
control of the applicant have prevented action from being taken. No 
application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew action 
on an application after expiration, the applicant shall reapply and pay a 
new plan review fee. Expiration amended. 

UMC Subsection 115.4.1 The Building Official shall extend the life of 
an application if any of the following conditions exists: 

UMC Subsection 115.4.1.2 Compliance with a declaration of 
significance under the State Environmental Policy Act provisions is in 
progress; or 

UMC Subsection 115.4.1.3 Any other City review is in progress, 
provided City staff determine that the review is proceeding to a timely 
final City decision; or 

UMC Subsection 115.4.1.4 Litigation against the City is in progress, the 
outcome of which may affect the validity of any permit issued pursuant 
to such application. 

UMC Subsection 115.4.1.5 Permit deemed ready to issue. Every permit 
deemed ready to issue by the Building Official under the provisions of 
this code shall be obtained by the applicant within 60 days of the 
notification of the availability of such permit by the Building Official. 

11 



Section 5. 

Upon cancellation of any such permit, the permit becomes null and void, 
and the Building Official shall so notify the applicant by certified mail. 

Intentionally left blank 

Section 6. UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE 

6.1 Short Title. This Chapter is known as and may be referred to as the Plumbing Code 
(UPC). 

6.2 Umform Plumbing Code Adopted. The Umform Plumbing Code 1991 Edition 
issued and published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechaillcal 
Officials adopted in its entirety, except Chapters 11, 12 and those required 
concerillng gas appliance venting in Chapter 13 are not adopted. 

Section 7. UNIFORM CODE FOR ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS. 

7.1 Short title. This chapter is known as and may be referred to as the "Dangerous 
Building Code". 

7.2 Adoption of codes. The Umform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 
1994 Edition, issued and published by the International Association of Building 
Officials except for § 91 0 and § 911, is adopted by this reference as if set forth in 
full, subject to amendments, additions, or deletions set forth. 

7.3 Notice and Order 

.1 Dangerous building code amendments. Subsection 401.2.3.6 added. Section 
401 of the Umform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Building is amended and 
supplemented by the addition thereto of a new subsection to be known as 
Subsection 401.2.3.6 to read as follows: 

The Building Official, together with the Director or delegate of the 
following City department: Commumty Development, Fire Services, 
Police Department and Public Works shall, upon written request filed 
with the Building Official by any interested person (including the 
Building official), conduct an informal conference relative to the matters 
set forth in the notice and order. All interested person shall be given 
notice of such conference and may attend and participate. Following 
such informal conference, the Building Official shall, within ten days 
thereof, file an amended or supplemental order and the time within 
which to appeal may be requested shall be extended to thirty days from 

12 



the date of such informal conference or fifteen days from service of the 
amended or supplemented order, whichever shall last occur . 

. 2 Service of notice and order. Section 401.3 of the Uniform Code for The 
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is hereby amended to read as follows: 

The notice and order and any amended or supplemental notice and/or order shall be 
served upon the record owner and posted on the property. The record owner for the 
purposes of the procedures of this chapter shall be the person listed in the records of 

the King County Department of Finance for the purposes of mailing Real Property 
Tax Statements. The Building Official shall also serve one copy on each of the 
following, if known to the Building Official or disclosed from the records of the 
King County Department of Finance, including tl1e records maintained in relation to 
the 1% estate excise sales tax: the holder of any mortgage, deed of trust, leasehold, 
contract purchaser, or contract seller. 

The failure of tl1e Building official to serve any person required herein to be served 
shall not invalidate any proceedings hereunder as to any other person duly served or 
relieve any such person from any duty or obligation imposed on him by the 
provisions of this section." 

.3 Report on costs and expenses. Section 901 of the uniform code for the 
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is hereby amended. 

DBC Section 901. The building Official shall keep an itemized account of the 
expenses incurred by the City in the repair or demolition of any building done 
pursuant to the provisions of Section 701.3.3 of this Code. Upon the completion of 
the work of repair or demolition, the Building Official shall prepare and file with the 
City Clerk a report specifying the work done, the itemized and total cost of the 
work, including the itemized and total cost of the work, including an administration 
and collection fee in the amount of two hundred ($200) dollars to cover the cost of 
publication, recording, and service of all notices, and the cost incurred by the City in 
the collection of the assessment or obligation as determined by Section 905 of this 
Code, a description of the real property upon which the building or structure is or 
was located, and the names and addresses of the persons entitled to notice pursuant 
to Section 401.3 . 

. 4 Collection of assessments. Section 909 of the Uniform Code for the Abatement 
of Dangerous Buildings is hereby amended: 

A copy of the ordinance confrmling the special assessment shall be filed with tl1e 
City Clerk. A certified copy of said ordinance shall be recorded with the King 
County Department of Elections and Records. The City Clerk upon receipt of said 

13 



A 
\,/ 

A 
\ / 
'-_.-

OfUGINAl 

ordinance shall proceed to collect the special assessment in the same manner as 
loc:il improvement district assessments, including installments thereof, are 
collected, provided however, that the thirty days prepayments notice need not be 
published but shall be mailed to the owner of record. 

Section 8. ELECTRICAL CODE 

8.1 Short Title. This Chapter is known as and may be referred to as the "Electrical 
Code". 

8.2 Adoption of Codes. The following codes, all as amended, added to, or excepted 
herein, together with all amendments and additions provided in this title, are 
adopted and shall be applicable within the City: 

.1 The National Electrical Code, 1993 Edition, and the 1993 
Uniform Administrative Code Provisions, as published by the 
National Fire Protection Association; and 

.2 Laws, Ru1es and Regu1ations for Installing Electric Wiring and 
Equipment, issued pursuant to Chapter 19.28 RCW Chapter 296 401 
WAC as presently constituted and as may be subsequently amended; 
and 

.3 The following chapters of the Washington Administrative Code 
as presently constituted and as may be subsequently amended: 

.1 Chapter 296-42 WAC -- Heating and Installations; and 

.2 Chapter 296-44 WAC -- Safety Standards - Electrical 
construction Code; and 

.3 Chapter 296-45 WAC -- Safety Standards - Electrical 
Workers 

.4 Chapter 296-46 WAC -- Safety Standards - Installing 
Electric Wires and Equipment 

.5 Chapter 296-47 WAC-- Electrical Wiring and Apparatus 

.6 Chapter 296-401 WAC -- Certification of Competency for 
Journeyman Electricians. · 

14 



a 
( ! 
·.,_,____) 

ORIGINAL 

8.3 Administration and enforcement. T11e codes, standards, rules, and regulations 
adopted by tins Chapter shall be adnllnistered and enforced by tile Washington State 
Department of Labor and Industries. 

Section 9. SEWAGE REGULATIONS SYSTEMS CODE 

9.1 Short title. Tills Chapter is known as and may be referred to as tile "Sewage 
Disposal Systems Code". 

9.2 County Sewage Code adopted. Title 13 (Board ofHealtll Sewage Regulations) 
Rules and Regulations #13 of tile Code of tile King County Board ofHealtll, as 
presently constituted and as may be subsequently amended, including Chapter 246 -
272 WAC Rules and Regulations of tile State Board ofHealtll 1995, is adopted and 
shall be applicable wiiliin tile City, as amended, added to, and excepted in tills 
Chapter. 

9.3 Amendment adoption. The following amendments, additions, and exceptions to tile 
Board ofHealtll Sewage Regulations, as adopted by tills Chapter, are amended, 
added to, or excepted as adopted and shall be applicable wiiliin tile City. 

9.4 Disposal Systems Maintenance. Sewage disposal systems shall be maintained in 
accordance witll tills Chapter and no sewage disposal system shall be used which 
directly or indirectly discharges upon tile surface of tile ground or into any waters 
wiiliin t11e City unless tile contents of such system have been subjected to approved 
purification and bactericidal treatment. 

9.5 Administration and enforcement. The codes, standards, rules, and regulations 
adopted by tills Chapter shall be adnllnistered by tile Seattle-King County 
Department of Public Healtll. 

Section 10. SIGN CONSTRUCTION CODE 

10.1 Short title. Tills Chapter is known as and may be referred to as tile "Sign 
Construction Code". 

10.2 

10.3 

Adoption of codes. The Uniform Sign code, 1994 Edition, issued and published by 
tile International Conference of Building Officials, is adopted and shall be 
applicable wiiliin tile City, as amended, added to and excepted in tills Chapter. 

Amendment adoption. The following amendments, additions, and exceptions to tile 
Uniform Sign code, as adopted by tills Chapter, are amended, added to, or excepted 
as adopted and shall be applicable wiiliin tile City. 

15 



0 
( ! 
:~ ____ / 

.1 Uniform Sign Code Section 210 amended--Marquee. Section 210 of the 
Uniform Sign Code, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended: 
USC Sec. 210 Marquee is permanent roofed structure attached to and 
supported by the building, providing protection from the weather 
elements, but does not include a projecting roof. For the purposes of this 
Chapter, a freestanding permanent roof-like structure providing 
protection from the weather elements such as a service station gas pump 
island, shall also be considered a marquee. 

Section 11. ADDITIONAL STATE CODES 

11.1 Short title. This chapter is known as and may be referred to as "Additional State 
Codes". 

11.2 Adoption of codes. The following as adopted by the Washington State Building 
Code Council pursuant to 19.27 RCW Chapters 51-11, 51-13 and 51-19 of the 
Washington Administrative Code as presently constituted and as may be 
subsequently amended are adopted and shall be applicable within the City: 

1. Chapter 51.11 WAC-- Washington State Energy Code; and 

2. Chapter 51.13 WAC-- Washington State Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality 
Code; 

3. Chapter 51-19 WAC-- Washington State Historic Building Code 

Section 12. FIRE CODE 

12.1 Short title. This chapter shall be known as and may be referred to as the "Fire 
Code". 

12.2 Adoption of codes. This Uniform Fire Code (UFC), 1991 Edition, including 
Appendix Chapters I-A, I-C, 11-A, 11-B, 11-C, 11-D, 11-E, 11-F, 11-G, 11-H, 11-I, ill-A, 
ill-B, ill-C, ill-D, IV-A, IV-B, V-A, VI-A, and VI-B, VI-E, and the Uniform Fire 
Code Standards, 1994 Edition, published by the International Fire Code Institute 
and Copyright© by the International Conference ofBui1ding Officials and the 
Western Fire Chiefs' Association and as adopted by the State of Washington 
pursuant to Chapters 51-34 and 51-35 Washington Administrative Code (WAC) 
are adopted by this reference as if set forth in full, subject to the amendments, 
additions, or deletions set forth. 

12.3 Definitions. Unless otherwise provided in this section, the de:frnitions in the 
Uniform Building Code and the Uniform Fire Code shall apply to this ·ordinance. 

16 



r. 
"/~ 

' ' \_' 

ORIGINAl 

A. "Life Safety\Rescue Access" shall mean access to all floor levels and each roof 
level of a building on not less than twenty percent of the building perimeter by 
utilizing a thirty-five foot ladder. An alternate method would be at least one 
stairway enclosure with exit doorways from each floor level and with a door 
opening onto each rooflevel which conforms to the requirement of the Uniform 
Building Code. 
B. "Fire Detection System" shall mean a heat and/or smoke detection system 
monitored by a central and/ or remote station conforming to the current requirements 
of the National Fire Protection Association standards and/or the Building Official, 
Fire Chief or their designee. 

C. "Fire Sprinkler System" shall mean an integrated system of piping connected to. a 
water supply with sprinklers which will automatically initiate water discharge over a 
fire, conforming to the current requirements of the National Fire Protection 
Association standards and/or Building Code, Fire Code, and their standards. 

12.4 Amendment adoption. The following amendments, additions, deletions, and 
exceptions to the Uniform Fire Code, Uniform Fire Code Appendix, and Uniform 
Fire Code Standards, as adopted by this Chapter, are adopted and shall be applicable 
within the City. 

12.4.1 Uniform Fire Code Section 1004.2. Standpipe required, Section 1004.2 of the 
Uniform Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1004.2 Required Installations. Standpipe systems shall be provided as set forth in Table 
No. 1004-A. 

In Lieu of Class II standpipes, the Fire Chief may, in writing, require the use of Class I 
standpipes. The size location, number of outlets, and the location of piping and fittings 
shall be approved by the Fire Chief or his/her designee. 

12.4.2 Uniform Fire Code Section 903.4.2. Water Supply, Section 903.4.2 of the Uniform 
Fire Code, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Number of hydrants shall be determined from Appendix III-B. Location of hydrants shall 
be determined by the Chief using the Woodinville Water Standards for hydrant spacing 
guidelines. The type of hydrants shall be approved by the Chief and the water purveyor. 
Existing substandard hydrant installations which serve new construction shall be 
upgraded prior to new combustible construction. 

Fire hydrants and their supplying mains shall be installed to the standard of the water 
purveyor and shall be dedicated along with repair easements, where needed, to the 
purveyor. 

17 



~------, 
~~~. 

\, ____ /:' 

ORIG~NAl 

For Fire Safety during construction, alterations, or demolition of a building, see Section 
8704.3. 
This section shall not apply to conditions existing prior to the effective date of this 
Chapter. 

12.4.3 Uniform Fire Code Appendix ID-B, Item 3 Number of hydrants. Item 3 of the 
Uniform Fire Code Appendix III-B, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended 
to read as follows: 

Section 3 Number of Hydrants 

The minimum number of hydrants available to a building shall be not less than that listed 
in Table No. A-III-B-1. The number of hydrants available to a complex or any 
subdivision shall not be less than that determined by spacing requirements listed on Table 
No. A-III-B-1 when applied to frre apparatus access roads and perimeter public streets 
from which fire operations may be conducted. 

Section 4 Existing hydrants on public streets may be considered available. Existing 
hydrants on adjacent properties shall not be considered available unless fire apparatus 
access roadways extend between properties and easements are established to prevent their 
obstruction. 

12.4.4 Uniform Fire Code Se~tion 1001.4.1. Maintenance and TeSting, Section 1001.4.1 
of the Uniform Fire Code, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as 
follows: 

(a) Maintenance and Testing. Fire alarm systems shall be maintained and tested in 
accordance with this article and nationally recognized standards. The Chief shall 
establish minimum requirements for periodic testing of fire alarm systems. In the case of 
dwelling units within an apartment building, it shall be the responsibility of the owner of 
the apartment, upon every change of tenancy of a dwelling unit, to inspect the fire 
warning system within such dwelling unit to determine if the same is in operating 
condition, the owner shall repair or replace the same and shall not allow occupancy of 
such dwelling unit until the frre warning system therein is operating properly. During 'the 
term of any tenancy of a dwelling unit in an apartment building, it shall be the 
responsibility of the tenant, and not the owner, to maintain the fire warning system 
therein in operating condition. 

12.4.5 New Section, Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.3.2. Design standards is added by 
this Chapter, is to read as follows: 

1007.3 .1.2 Design 

18 



ORIGINAl 

All fire alarm plans submitted for approval shall bear the designer's valid Washington 
State Low Voltage Specialty Electrical Contractor's License number or shall be stamped 
by a registered fire protection or electrical engineer. 

12.4.6 Uniform Fire Code Section 1001.3. Plans for Fire Alarm Systems, as adopted by 
this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1001.3 Plans for Fire Alarm Systems. All systems shall have complete plans and 
specifications submitted for review and approval prior to system installation. 

Building Department Operating Policy #14 "Procedures for Fire Alarm Systems 
Submittals" and Building Department Operating Policy #40 "Procedures for Fire 
Sprinkler Systems Submittals" shall be complied with when applying for a permit 

12.4.7 Uniform Fire Code Section 1001.4. Approval and Testing, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1001.4 Approval and Testing. Fire alarm systems; fire-extinguishing systems; including 
automatic sprinklers and wet and dry standpipes; halon systems and other special types of 
automatic fire-extinguishing systems; basement pipe inlets; and other fire-protection 
systems and appurtenances thereto shall meet the approval of the fire department as to 
installation and location and shall be subject to such periodic tests as required by the 
chief. See appendix III -C. 

Condition of approval of halon systems shall be satisfactory passage of a test conducted 
in accordance with nationally recognized standards prior to final acceptance of the 
system. 

Fire alarm and detection systems shall be tested in accordance with NFPA 72 and other 
nationally recognized standards. 

12.4.8 New Section, Uniform Fire Code Section 1001.3.1. Permit Fee, as adopted by 
this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1001.3.1 Permit Fee 

No person or agency shall install, alter, replace or perform repair of a fire alarm system 
within the City without first obtaining a permit to be issued by the City. Upon a 
determination by the Chief of the Fire Department or his designee that the fire alarm 
system, for which a permit is requested, complies with said codes and ordinances and is 
approved, and the appropriate fee is received, the permit shall be issued; provided, 
however, that no permit shall be required for single station detectors. 

19 



A \ .. 

ORIGIIMAl 

12.4.9 Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.1.4. Problematic systems and systems out of 
service, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.1.4 Problematic systems and systems out of service. 

In the event of temporary failure of the alarm system or an excessive number of 
accidental alarm activation's, the chief is authorized to require the building owner or 
occupanno provide standby personnel as set forth in UFC Article 25, Section 201.19 
until the system is restored. The chief is authorized to charge for recovery of costs to the 
Fire District based on the current Washington State Association of Fire Chiefs' Fee 
Schedule. Woodinville Fire and Life Safety District Manual of Operation, Article 800, 
Section 15 "Documentation of False Fire Alarms" shall apply. 

12.4.10 New Section. Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.1.6. Section 1007.1.6 as 
adopted by this Chapter, Standards is hereby to read as follows: 

1007.1.6 Standards 

All fire alarm systems shall be installed in accordance with the ordinances of the City, 
and the following Codes and Standards; 
I. National Fire Protection Association 72, National Fire Alarm Code 1993 Edition 
II. Uniform Fire Code volume 1, 1994 Edition 
III. Uniform Building Code volume 1 
IV. Washington State Building Code, Chapter 51-20 WAC 
V. 1994 Uniform Fire Code Washington State Amendments 

12.4.11 New Section. Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.2.1.1.1. Required Installations, 
as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby to read as follows: 

1 007.2.1.1.1 In addition to the required installations of Fire Alarm Systems, an automatic 
fire detection system shall be installed in all occupancies exceeding 3,000 square feet 
gross floor area. 

Exceptions: 
1. R 3 and all U occupancies 
2. The requirement for automatic fire detection providing full coverage may be 

waived when the building is fully protected by an approved automatic fire extinguishing 
system equipped with the water flow alarm connected to the building fire alarm system 
and the fire alarm system is monitored by a approved central station. All other 
requirements of this ordinance shall still apply. 

In buildings not protected by an automatic fire sprinkler system, detectors shall be placed 
in locations as required by the Fire Marshal. 

20 



A 

.n 
~·· 

ORIG~~Al 

Detectors shall be placed in all rooms, halls, storage areas, basements, attics, lofts, spaces 
above suspended ceilings, kitchens, storage lockers, closets, electrical rooms, machine 
equipment rooms, and elevator equipment rooms. 

In places where there is moisture or excessive heat, such as laundry rooms, bathrooms, 
kitchens, and boiler rooms heat detectors shall be used. 

Any fire alarm control unit that utilizes a combination to reset after alarm shall use the 
following combination; 3-6-1-2-3-etc. 

12.4.12 New Section, Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.2.1.1.2. Zoning, as adopted by 
this Chapter, is hereby to read as follows: 

1007.2.1.1.2 Zoning 

Fire alarm systems shall be divided into alarm zones when required by the chief. ·All 
buildings having area separation walls shall also have fire alarm systems zoned for each 
separated area. Each tenant space in a strip mall shall have a zone for each tenant. Each 
storage unit in a Mini Storage facility shall be identified at the annunciation panel. 

Zoning of fire alarm systems shall be made if: 
a. the building is multi-storied (2 or more including basements). 
b. the building is split into several areas. 
c. the building has more than one use, one of which is hazardous. 
d. the building has a sprinkler system that is required to be monitored. 
e. the building is divided into multiple occupancies. 
f. the Fire Marshal determines that there are extenuating circumstances that warrant 
zonmg. 

All water flow devices shall be on a separate zone. 

12.4.13 Uniform Fire Code Section 1 007.2.2.1. General, as adopted by this Chapter, is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007 .2.2.1 General. All group A occupancies shall be provided with a manual fire alarm 
system in accordance with Section 1007.2.2 

Exception: Group A Occupancy portions of Group E Occupancies are allowed to have 
alarms as required for the GroupE Occupancy. 

See also Section 1007.2.12 

21 



C' 

OfUG~NJU. 

12.4.14 Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.2.7.2.4. Smoke Detection, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.2.7.2.4 Smoke detection. An approved automatic smoke-detection system shall be 
installed throughout resident housing areas, including sleeping areas and contiguous day 
rooms, group activity spaces, and other common spaces normally accessible to residents. 

Exception: Other approved smoke-detection arrangements providing equivalent 
protection, such as placing detectors in exhaust ducts from cells or behind protective 
grilles, are allowed when necessary to prevent damage or tampering. This exception shall 
only be allowed with a technical report from an expert approved by the Chief. 

12.4,15 New Section Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.2.8.1. Mini Storage Complex, 
as adopted by this Chapter, is to read as follows: 

1007 .2.8.1 Each separate storage unit of a Mini Storage Complex shall be individually 
identified at the armunciator panel. 

12.4.16 Uniform Fire Code Section 1 007.2.9.1.1. Required Installations, as adopted by 
this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.2.9 .1.1. General. Group R Occupancies shall be provided with fire alarm systems 
in accordance with Section 1 007.2.9 Group R, Division 1 Occupancies shall be provided 
with a manual and automatic fire alarm system in apartment houses three or more stories 
in height or containing 16 or more dwelling units, in hotels three or more stories in height 
or containing 20 or more guest rooms, and in congregate residences three or more stories 
in height or having an occupant load of20 or more. See also 1007.2.12 

Exception: A separate fire alarm system need not be provided in buildings which are 
protected throughout by an approved supervised fire sprinkler system conforming with 
the Building Code and having a local alarm to notifY all occupants. 

1007.2.9.1.2 Delete 

12.4.17 Uniform Fire Code Section 1 007.2.9.2. Single Station smoke detectors, as 
adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.2.9.2 Single-station smoke detectors. 

Approved single-station smoke detectors shall be installed in dwelling units, congregate 
residences and hotel or lodging house guest rooms in accordance with the Building Code 
and NFPA 72, Chapter 2, Section 2-2.2.1 which states that in new construction, where 
more than one smoke detector is required byNFPA 2-2.1, they shall be so arranged that 

22 



A 

ORIGINAl 

operation of any smoke detector shall cause the alarm in all smoke detectors within the 
dwelling to sound. 

Exception: Configurations that provide equivalent distribution of the alarm signal. 
Single-station smoke detectors shall not be connected to a fire alarm system. See also 
Section 1007.2.9.1.5. 

Exception: Connection of such detectors for annunciation only. 

12.4.18 New Section. Uniform Fire Code Section 1007 2.1 0.1. Required Installations, 
as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby to read as follows. 

· 1007.2.10.1 Each separate storage unit of a Mini Storage Complex shall be individually 
identified at the enunciator panel. 

12.4.19 Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.2.12.2.3. Emergency voice alarm-signaling 
system, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007 .2.12.2.3 Emergency voice alarm-signaling system. The operation of any automatic 
fire detector, sprinkler or water-flow device shall automatically sound an alert tone 
followed by voice instructions giving appropriate information and directions on a general 
or selective basis to the following terminal areas: 

1. 
2. 

4. 
5. 
6. 
7. 

Elevators, 
Elevator lobbies, 
Corridors, 
Exit stairways, 
Rooms and tenant spaces exceeding 1,000 square feet in area, 
Dwelling units in apartment houses, and 
Hotel guest rooms or suites. 

A manual override for emergency voice communication shall be provided for all paging 
zones. 
The emergency voice alarm-signaling system shall be designed and installed in· 
accordance with the Building Code and NFP A 72. 

12.4.20 Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.2.12.9.2.1. Audible alarms, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows. 

1007.2.12.9.2.1 Audible alarms. Audible alarms shall produce a sound in accordance 
with NFPA 72. Audible alarms shall exceed the prevailing equivalent sound level in the 
room or space by at least 15 decibels, or shall exceed any maximum sound level with a 

23 



ORIGINAL 
duration of 30 seconds by 5 decibels, which ever is louder. Sound levels for alarm 
signals shall not exceed 120 decibels. 

12.4. 21 Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.3.1. General System Design and installation 
Requirements, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.3.1 Design standards. Fire alarm systems, automatic fire detectors, emergency 
voice alarm communication systems and notification devices shall be designed, installed, 
and maintained in accordance with NFP A 72 and other nationally recognized standards. 

12.4.22 Uniform Fire Code Section 1 007.3.3.5. Supervision, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.3.3.5 Supervision. Means of interconnecting equipment, devices and appliances 
shall be supervised for the integrity of the interconnecting conductors or equivalent, as set 
forth in NFP A 72. 

12.4.23 Uniform Fire Code Section 1 007.3.3.6.1. General, as adopted by this Chapter, 
is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.3.3.6.1 General. When required by the chief, fire alarm systems shall be monitored 
by an approved central, proprietary or remote station service or a local alarm which gives 
audible and visual signals at a constantly attended location. All fire alarm/detection 
systems within an individual building shall be monitored by a single approved monitoring 
system. 

12.4.24 Uniform Fire Code Section 1 007.3.3.7. Annunciation, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.3.3. 7 Annunciation When two or more alarm zones are required, visible 
annunciation shall be provided in a location approved by the chief. 
Visual annunciation shall be provided at the main entrance to the building, or as located 
by the Fire Marshal's Office. 

Visual zone alarm indication: The location of an operated initiating device shall be 
visually indicated by building, floor, frre zone, or other approved subdivision by 
annunciation, print-out, or other approved means. The visual indication shall not be 
canceled by the operation of an audible alarm silencing switch. 

12.4.25 New Section. Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.3.3.7.1. Exterior alarm­
signaling device, as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby to read as follows: 

24 



(~, 

( .. '. 
'-__./ 

ORIGINAl 
I 007.3.3. 7 .I Exterior alarm-signaling device. All alarm systems shall have an alarm­
signaling device mounted on the exterior of the building. l11is device shall be a listed I 0" 
bell/strobe or hom/strobe listed for exterior use. UFC 1003.3.2 In all buildings with 
sprinkler systems an approved audible sprinkler flow alarm to alert the occupants shall be 
provided in the interior of the building in a normally occupied location. 

12.4.26 Uniform Fire Code Section I 007.3.4.2. Certification, as adopted by this 
Chapter, is hereby amended to read as follows. 

1007.3.4.2 Certification 

The permittee shall provide written certification to the chief that the system has been 
installed in accordance with the approved plans and specifications. A Certificate of 
Completion (see NFPA 72, 1-7.2) shall be completed for each installation. 

12.4.27 Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.3.4.3. Instructions, as adopted by this Chapter, 
. is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1007.3.4.3 Instructions. Operating, testing and maintenance instructions and "as built" 
drawings and equipment specifications shall be provided and located next to the Fire 
Alarm Control Panel in a protective binder. 

12.4.28 New Section. Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.3.4.4. Commercial (non­
required fire alarm system), as adopted by this Chapter, is hereby to read as 
follows: 

1007.3.4.4 Commercial (non-required fire alarm system) 

This section pertains to structures of a commercial nature wherein a fire alarm system is 
not required. All commercial structures shall be provided with a fire alarm system 
control panel. The system shall be installed and function as per NFP A 72. 

12.4.29 New Section. Uniform Fire Code Section 1007.3.4.5. Electrical inspection, as 
adopted by this Chapter, is hereby to read as follows: 

1007.3.4.5 Electrical Inspection 
All fire alarm system installations shall be inspected and approved by the Washington 
State Labor and Industries Electrical Division before final approval will be given. 

12.4.30 Life Safe1y/Rescue Access. 

a. Life Safety/rescue access. All occupancies shall be required to provide approved life 
safety /rescue access. 

25 



ORIGINAl 

Exceptions: 
1. Group U Occupancies. 
2. Roof access need not be provided to rooflevels having slope greater than 4 in 12. 

12.4.31 Fire Sprinkler Systems shall be installed: 

.1 In all Group R, Division 3 occupancies exceeding 2,500 square feet gross floor 
area (including attached garages) without adequate :fire flow . 

. 2 In all R-3 occupancies without approved fire department access as defined in 
Woodinville Ordinance 49, appendix G . 

• 3 In all Group R, Division 1 occupancies having three or more floor levels or 
containing three or more dwelling units and hotels (motels) having three or more 
floor levels or containing ten or more guest rooms. Quick response standard 
sprinkler heads shall be used in accordance with their approved listing in the 
dwelling unit and guest room portions of the building. Area separation walls as 
noted in Section 504.6 of the Uniform Building Code shall not be considered to 
separate a building to enable deletion of the required fire sprinkler system . 

.4 In group A occupancies when the occupant load exceeds 200 (i.e., 201 or 
more), the whole building shall be sprinklered. Area separation walls as noted in 
Section 504.6 of the Uniform Building Code shall not be considered to separate a 
building to enable deletion of the required fire sprinkler system . 

. 5 Theaters. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in every building 
containing a multiple theater complex . 

. 6 Amusement Buildings. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all 
amusement buildings. The main waterflow switch shall be electrically supervised. 
The sprinkler shutoff valve shall be supervised. When the amusement building is 

temporary, the sprinkler water-supply may be of an approved temporary type. 
Exception: An automatic sprinkler system need not be provided when the floor 
area of a temporary amusement building or occupancy is Jess than 1,000 square 
feet and the exit travel distance from any point is less than 50 feet . 

. 7 In all other occupancies requiring 2,000 gallons per minute or more fire flow, or 
where the total floor area included within the surrounding exterior walls on all 
floor levels including basements exceeds 10,000 square feet. Area separation 
walls, as noted in Section 504.6 of the Uniform Building Code, shall not be 
considered to separate a building to enable deletion of the required fire sprinkler 
system. 
Exception: Group U occupancies. 

26 



_q 
( ' 
"--j 

ORIGINAL 

12.4.32 Alterations. repairs. and building additions. The provisions of the ordinance shall 
apply to all buildings to which more than fifty percent of its county assessed value 
at the time of the first permit application will be altered or repaired within any 
seventy month period of time. Any additions to an existing structure shall be 
considered new construction and subject to the provisions of this ordinance. 

Section 13. SEVERABILITY 

13.1 Severability. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of tllis ordinance should be 
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such 
invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of 
any other section, sentence, clause or phrase of tllls ordinance. 

Section 14. ORDINANCE REPEALED 

14.1 Repealed Ordinances. Ordinance Nos. 35 and 36 are hereby repealed in their 
entirety. 

Section 15. EFFECTIVE DATE 

15.1 Effective date. This ordinance shall be effective as of 7/8 , 1995, which is 
more than five (5) days after publication of an approved summary consisting of 
the title to this ordinance. 

PASSED by the City Council of the City ofWoodinvillethis 26th day of 
_;,_Jun_-_e __ , 1995. 

APPROVED: 

PROVED AS TO FORM: 
OFFICE OF THE CITY TORNEY: 

27 

--- ·--·---------------



ORIGINAl 

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: June 26, 1995 
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL: June 26, 1995 
PUBLISHED: July 3, 1995 
EFFECTIVEDATE: July 8, 1995 
ORDINANCE NO. 121 

28 


